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PRESS RELEASE 
March 26, 2019  

 
 

ALTO Aviation and ROSEN Aviation announce a strategic partnership  
at the 62nd AEA International Convention & Trade Show in Palm Springs. 

 
ALTO Aviation, an industry leader in cabin audio/entertainment systems, Cabin Management 
Systems (CMS), and Passenger Controls, and Rosen Aviation, designer and manufacturer of cabin 
electronic devices, have officially announced a strategic retrofit market partnership at the 62nd 
edition of AEA International Convention & Trade Show in Palm Springs. 

Through this new partnership, ALTO Aviation becomes the one-stop option for customers looking 
to solve obsolescence issues, as well as for customers looking for simple, budget-friendly, 
customized upgrades to their existing cabin CMS/IFE.  

“We’re excited to partner with an industry leader such as Rosen,” stated Don Hamilton, President 
of ALTO Aviation. “Their products are second to none in both performance and reliability. Adding 
video to our CMS offering will allow us to serve our customers for complete cabin solutions 
better.” 

“We are pleased to collaborate with a partner of ALTO’s stature to better serve the retrofit 
market,” stated Carlos Carrai, President of Rosen Aviation.  “Our collective reputations for 
product capability, quality, and customer support make this an appealing option for our 
aftermarket customers.” 

For more information, please visit ALTO Aviation at booth # 930 and Rosen Aviation at booth # 
604. 



 

 
 
 
About ALTO Aviation 
 
ALTO Aviation is an aerospace industry leader in the design and manufacture of high-end cabin 
audio & entertainment systems for all aircraft type in Business Aviation. Our products and 
solutions, which include Inflight Entertainment Systems, Public Address Systems, and Cabin 
Management Systems are sold to OEM and retrofit companies in the business aviation industry 
and installed in corporate/private/VIP jets and helicopters. ALTO also manufactures precision 
sheet metal and machined parts for multiple industries in addition to aerospace.  
 
If you would like more information or would like to schedule an interview with one of our ALTO 
Aviation representatives, please contact Cristina Scarlata at cscarlata@altoaviation.com 
 
 
About ROSEN Aviation  
 
Founded in 1983 Rosen offers vertically integrated R&D, design, and manufacturing 
solutions.  Our process focus and dedication to customer satisfaction have earned numerous 
awards for excellence in product quality, on-time delivery, and product support. 

 
 
For more information, visit www.rosenaviation.com     
 
 
 

 


